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Get expert guidance on architecting end-to-end data management solutions with Apache Hadoop. While
many sources explain how to use various components in the Hadoop ecosystem, this practical book takes you
through architectural considerations necessary to tie those components together into a complete tailored
application, based on your particular use case.

To reinforce those lessons, the book’s second section provides detailed examples of architectures used in
some of the most commonly found Hadoop applications. Whether you’re designing a new Hadoop
application, or planning to integrate Hadoop into your existing data infrastructure, Hadoop Application
Architectures will skillfully guide you through the process.

This book covers:

Factors to consider when using Hadoop to store and model data●

Best practices for moving data in and out of the system●

Data processing frameworks, including MapReduce, Spark, and Hive●

Common Hadoop processing patterns, such as removing duplicate records and using windowing analytics●

Giraph, GraphX, and other tools for large graph processing on Hadoop●

Using workflow orchestration and scheduling tools such as Apache Oozie●

Near-real-time stream processing with Apache Storm, Apache Spark Streaming, and Apache Flume●

Architecture examples for clickstream analysis, fraud detection, and data warehousing●
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From reader reviews:

Angela Rodriguez:

A lot of people always spent their particular free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them
family members or their friend. Did you know? Many a lot of people spent that they free time just watching
TV, or perhaps playing video games all day long. If you want to try to find a new activity this is look
different you can read the book. It is really fun in your case. If you enjoy the book that you simply read you
can spent the entire day to reading a guide. The book Hadoop Application Architectures it is very good to
read. There are a lot of people that recommended this book. These were enjoying reading this book. Should
you did not have enough space bringing this book you can buy typically the e-book. You can m0ore
effortlessly to read this book from a smart phone. The price is not too costly but this book provides high
quality.

Yadira Singh:

As we know that book is vital thing to add our knowledge for everything. By a e-book we can know
everything we want. A book is a group of written, printed, illustrated or perhaps blank sheet. Every year
ended up being exactly added. This reserve Hadoop Application Architectures was filled about science.
Spend your time to add your knowledge about your scientific disciplines competence. Some people has
various feel when they reading a new book. If you know how big advantage of a book, you can feel enjoy to
read a reserve. In the modern era like currently, many ways to get book that you wanted.

Daniel Bailey:

That book can make you to feel relax. That book Hadoop Application Architectures was multi-colored and of
course has pictures on there. As we know that book Hadoop Application Architectures has many kinds or
style. Start from kids until teenagers. For example Naruto or Private investigator Conan you can read and
believe that you are the character on there. Therefore not at all of book are make you bored, any it can make
you feel happy, fun and chill out. Try to choose the best book for you and try to like reading that will.

Richard Lawrence:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that question when you got scholars? We believe that that query was
given by teacher with their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every person has different hobby. And you also
know that little person including reading or as reading through become their hobby. You must know that
reading is very important in addition to book as to be the matter. Book is important thing to add you
knowledge, except your own teacher or lecturer. You find good news or update concerning something by
book. Many kinds of books that can you choose to adopt be your object. One of them is actually Hadoop
Application Architectures.
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