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Aleister Crowley's life and thought are inexorably linked with The Book of the Law (Liber AL vel Legis, sub
figura CCXX). He was not the author of this short, prophetic text. He received this visionary work by direct-
voice dictation from a preterhuman, possibly discarnate intelligence in Cairo in 1904.

Crowley was an intelligent sceptic, and at first found this improbable means of communication as difficult to
accept as most intelligent readers will today. Yet he could not ignore it or its message, and eventually
concluded that it stood as conclusive proof of the underlying assumption of all religion - that intelligences
superior to mankind not only exist, but take an active role in our welfare. He found that The Book of the Law
holds the keys to the Next Step in human evolution, and sets forth the spiritual principles of a New Aeon.

He worked for decades to interpret its meaning for initiates and the general public, but rejected commentary
after commentary as inadequate. He eventually concluded that he was too close to his subject to judge the
value of his own commentaries, and entrusted the task to his best friend, Louis Wilkinson. Wilkinson (who
wrote under the pen-name Louis Marlow) possessed impressive literary qualifications and had the
advantages of knowing Crowley well and being a layman in esoteric matters. The result of his work is this
long-awaited authorized popular edition of Crowley's new commentary on The Book of the Law, and its first
appearance as Crowley wished it. Louis Wilkinson's editorial work was posthumously completed and
augmented by Frater Superior Hymenaeus Beta of the O.T.O. This new edition features annotations, reading
lists and indexes, as well as an insightful introduction by Louis Wilkinson.
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From reader reviews:

Esther Price:

The book The Law Is for All: The Authorized Popular Commentary of Liber Al Vel Legis Sub Figura
CCXX, The Book of the Law can give more knowledge and information about everything you want. Why
must we leave the good thing like a book The Law Is for All: The Authorized Popular Commentary of Liber
Al Vel Legis Sub Figura CCXX, The Book of the Law? A number of you have a different opinion about
book. But one aim which book can give many info for us. It is absolutely correct. Right now, try to closer
along with your book. Knowledge or information that you take for that, you could give for each other; you
are able to share all of these. Book The Law Is for All: The Authorized Popular Commentary of Liber Al Vel
Legis Sub Figura CCXX, The Book of the Law has simple shape but you know: it has great and massive
function for you. You can seem the enormous world by open up and read a e-book. So it is very wonderful.

Catherine Gabel:

Do you one among people who can't read pleasurable if the sentence chained from the straightway, hold on
guys that aren't like that. This The Law Is for All: The Authorized Popular Commentary of Liber Al Vel
Legis Sub Figura CCXX, The Book of the Law book is readable by you who hate those straight word style.
You will find the information here are arrange for enjoyable looking at experience without leaving perhaps
decrease the knowledge that want to give to you. The writer of The Law Is for All: The Authorized Popular
Commentary of Liber Al Vel Legis Sub Figura CCXX, The Book of the Law content conveys prospect
easily to understand by many individuals. The printed and e-book are not different in the content but it just
different by means of it. So , do you nevertheless thinking The Law Is for All: The Authorized Popular
Commentary of Liber Al Vel Legis Sub Figura CCXX, The Book of the Law is not loveable to be your top
collection reading book?

Dale Hollander:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray you actually, why because this The Law Is for All: The Authorized
Popular Commentary of Liber Al Vel Legis Sub Figura CCXX, The Book of the Law e-book written by
well-known writer whose to say well how to make book which can be understand by anyone who all read the
book. Written within good manner for you, dripping every ideas and composing skill only for eliminate your
own hunger then you still doubt The Law Is for All: The Authorized Popular Commentary of Liber Al Vel
Legis Sub Figura CCXX, The Book of the Law as good book not just by the cover but also by content. This
is one e-book that can break don't determine book by its deal with, so do you still needing another sixth sense
to pick this particular!? Oh come on your looking at sixth sense already told you so why you have to
listening to a different sixth sense.



Debbie Gagnon:

The book untitled The Law Is for All: The Authorized Popular Commentary of Liber Al Vel Legis Sub
Figura CCXX, The Book of the Law contain a lot of information on that. The writer explains your girlfriend
idea with easy way. The language is very simple to implement all the people, so do definitely not worry, you
can easy to read the idea. The book was written by famous author. The author will bring you in the new
period of literary works. You can actually read this book because you can continue reading your smart
phone, or device, so you can read the book in anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can
wide open their official web-site and also order it. Have a nice learn.
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