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The Beatles Solo on Apple Records details the solo records released by John, Paul, George and Ringo on
their own Apple label in America from 1968 through 1975. It tells the stories behind classic solo albums
such as Imagine, Band On The Run, All Things Must Pass and Ringo. All solo projects are covered in
matriclous detail, including all of the albums and singles released by John & Yoko and Paul McCartney &
Wings. The book provides complete session and chart information and shows all picture sleeves, album
covers and label variations, along with many of the promotional posters, displays and trade magazine ads.
The book is hard cover and printed on heavy weight glossy paper. It has over 900 images (all in full color or
original black & white) spread throughout the book's 358 pages. The book is the followup to the critically
acclaimed The Beatles on Apple Records, which covered the records released by the group from 1968
through 1970 and is still available from Midpoint.
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From reader reviews:

Richard Benson:

Book is written, printed, or illustrated for everything. You can understand everything you want by a book.
Book has a different type. To be sure that book is important issue to bring us around the world. Close to that
you can your reading talent was fluently. A reserve The Beatles Solo on Apple Records will make you to
become smarter. You can feel considerably more confidence if you can know about anything. But some of
you think that open or reading any book make you bored. It is not necessarily make you fun. Why they could
be thought like that? Have you looking for best book or appropriate book with you?

Milford Garrett:

A lot of people always spent all their free time to vacation or go to the outside with them friends and family
or their friend. Do you know? Many a lot of people spent many people free time just watching TV, or
playing video games all day long. If you want to try to find a new activity here is look different you can read
a new book. It is really fun to suit your needs. If you enjoy the book that you simply read you can spent all
day long to reading a reserve. The book The Beatles Solo on Apple Records it is very good to read. There are
a lot of people that recommended this book. These were enjoying reading this book. When you did not have
enough space to develop this book you can buy typically the e-book. You can m0ore effortlessly to read this
book from the smart phone. The price is not too costly but this book possesses high quality.

Michael Greene:

You may spend your free time to read this book this guide. This The Beatles Solo on Apple Records is
simple bringing you can read it in the recreation area, in the beach, train in addition to soon. If you did not
have got much space to bring the printed book, you can buy the actual e-book. It is make you easier to read
it. You can save the actual book in your smart phone. Thus there are a lot of benefits that you will get when
you buy this book.

Harry Dwyer:

A lot of reserve has printed but it differs. You can get it by world wide web on social media. You can choose
the top book for you, science, comedian, novel, or whatever through searching from it. It is named of book
The Beatles Solo on Apple Records. You can include your knowledge by it. Without departing the printed
book, it can add your knowledge and make you happier to read. It is most important that, you must aware
about guide. It can bring you from one destination to other place.
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